
Buyer: Brenda Sensibaugh 6710 OF
Corrosion Inhibited Solid Sodium Chloride (Clear Roads Product Category 4C)

Opening Date: 09/09/22

Description Qty UOM Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
1  TRUCKLOAD DISTRICT 1 PRICE ON  PEAK 420 TN  $           111.60  $      46,872.00  $           181.00  $      76,020.00  $   176.90  $                 74,298.00 
2  TRUCKLOAD DISTRICT 1 PRICE OFF PEAK 420 TN  $           106.60  $      44,772.00  $           178.00  $      74,760.00  $   170.35  $                 71,547.00 
3 TOTE DISTRICT 1 PRICE ANNUAL 25 TN  N/A  $   375.00  $                   9,375.00 
4 TRUCKLOAD DISTRICT 2 PRICE ON  PEAK 200 TN  $           115.10  $      23,020.00  $           186.00  $      37,200.00  $   181.40  $                 36,280.00 
5 TRUCKLOAD DISTRICT 2 PRICE OFF PEAK 200 TN  $           110.10  $      22,020.00  $           182.00  $      36,400.00  $   174.80  $                 34,960.00 
6 TOTE DISTRICT 2 PRICE ANNUAL 25 TN  N/A  $   390.00  $                   9,750.00 
7 TRUCKLOAD DISTRICT 3 PRICE ON  PEAK 275 TN  $           119.82  $      32,950.50  $           189.50  $      52,112.50  $   186.80  $                 51,370.00 
8 TRUCKLOAD DISTRICT 3 PRICE OFF PEAK 275 TN  $           114.82  $      31,575.50  $           186.00  $      51,150.00  $   178.80  $                 49,170.00 
9 TOTE DISTRICT 3 PRICE ANNUAL 25 TN  N/A  $   420.00  $                 10,500.00 

10 TRUCKLOAD DISTRICT 4 PRICE ON  PEAK 2025 TN  $           145.21  $    294,050.25  $           172.50  $    349,312.50  $   168.70  $               341,617.50 
11 TRUCKLOAD DISTRICT 4 PRICE OFF PEAK 2025 TN  $           140.21  $    283,925.25  $           169.00  $    342,225.00  $   162.10  $               328,252.50 
12 TOTE DISTRICT 4  PRICE ANNUAL 25 TN  N/A  $   360.00  $                   9,000.00 
13 TRUCKLOAD DISTRICT 5 PRICE ON  PEAK 1400 TN  No Bid  $           180.00  $    252,000.00  $   147.70  $               206,780.00 
14 TRUCKLOAD DISTRICT 5 PRICE OFF PEAK 1400 TN  No Bid  $           178.00  $    249,200.00  $   141.60  $               198,240.00 
15 TOTE DISTRICT 5  PRICE ANNUAL 25 TN  No Bid  $   380.00  $                   9,500.00 
16 TRUCKLOAD DISTRICT 6 PRICE ON  PEAK 3225 TN  $           151.63  $    489,006.75  $           162.50  $    524,062.50  $   166.90  $               538,252.50 
17 TRUCKLOAD DISTRICT 6 PRICE OFF PEAK 3225 TN  $           146.21  $    471,527.25  $           159.00  $    512,775.00  $   156.75  $               505,518.75 
18 TOTE DISTRICT 6  PRICE ANNUAL 25 TN  N/A  $   330.00  $                   8,250.00 
19 TRUCKLOAD DISTRICT 7 PRICE OFF PEAK 700 TN  $           150.37  $    105,259.00  $           164.50  $    115,150.00  $   169.75  $               118,825.00 
20 TRUCKLOAD DISTRICT 7 PRICE ON  PEAK 700 TN  $           145.52  $    101,864.00  $           161.00  $    112,700.00  $   162.50  $               113,750.00 
21 TOTE DISTRICT 7 PRICE ANNUAL 25 TN  No Bid  $   390.00  $                   9,750.00 
22 TRUCKLOAD DISTRICT 8 PRICE OFF PEAK 100 TN  No Bid  $           174.50  $      17,450.00  $   185.80  $                 18,580.00 
23 TRUCKLOAD DISTRICT 8 PRICE ON  PEAK 100 TN  No Bid  $           171.00  $      17,100.00  $   177.80  $                 17,780.00 
24 TOTE DISTRICT 8 PRICE ANNUAL 25 TN  No Bid  $   380.00  $                   9,500.00 

 $ 1,946,842.50  $ 2,819,617.50  $            2,780,846.25 

NO BID
Compass Minerals

NSG Logistics, LLC dba Nebraska 
Salt and Grain 

TOTAL
Payment Terms

Delivery Days ARO
Comments

Net 30 Days
10

Li
ne

 # Description
Jeffres Sand & Gravel Inc

Net 30 Days
10

Central Salt, LLC

10
N/A N/A Days
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